
 

William Sharp, Sr. 
3 Jul 1742 – 12 Mar 1833 

Private, CPT William Kincaid; Colonel Samson Matthews & Spy for Warwick's Fort, VA 
 

William Sharp/Sharpe was born around 1740 at Beverly Manor. He was the son of John (1714-1749) & 
Margery Sharp (1718-1750), also spelled Sharpe. In 1749 William's father, John Sharp, was killed by Indians. It 
is said that the following year his mother, Margery, was also killed by Indians, leaving William and three 
younger siblings. It is known that William was bound as an orphaned apprentice to John Anderson, a tanner, of 
Beverly Manor, Augusta Parish in February 1750. In the year 1769, William married Mary Meeks, daughter of 
John Meeks (1706-1761) and Ann Meeks. John and his wife Ann, were killed during an Indian raid in 1761, 
leaving five children. 

William Sharp, Sr was a pioneer settler of Pocahontas County and was the first to open up a permanent 
homestead in the Huntersville vicinity. This was located a few yards from the intersection of the Dunmore and 
Huntersville road. It is thought Wm Sharp had likely been living in the county prior to 1769 to be so familiar 
with the Greenbrier property he was granted, where he located his permanent homestead about 1773. 

He served in the Rev War as a scout, spy and soldier against the Indians and the British. His affidavit in 1832 
stated he did four short tours of service totaling over two years and six months. These includes an expedition 
against the Indians on the Muskingham River in the fall of 1764 until March 1765; his service as an Indian spy 
during the summer of 1773 and summer of 1774; and he served as a scout and messenger from the summer of 
1774 to December 1774. Records from the American Daughters of the Revolution state that William Sharp 
served as a private and fifer in Capt. Lewis Pelham's Company, Colonel Parker's Virginia regiment in 1778. 
William was again drafted in January 1781 and was in a skirmish against the British at Portsmouth, Virginia. He 
was discharged there in April 1781. William Sharp's Declaration, September 4th, 1832: Age 92; was drafted in 
1781 in the Company of Capt. William Kinkead; James Trimble was Ensign, Regiment of Col. Sampson 
Mathews. In 1774 he was drafted in the Company of Capt. Andrew Lockridge in an expedition against the 
Indians. He and William Mann were sent by Col. Andrew Lewis with a message to Governor Dunmore, then at 
Fort Pitt, and only returned the day after the battle. In 1764 he volunteered under Capt. Charles Lewis on an 
expedition against the Indians on Muskingham River. Lieutenant McClenachan belonged to Captain Lewis' 
Company. Declarant remembers Colonels Field and McNeel. He states he served also as Indian spy in 1773. ~ 
Cackley's Chronicles of the Scot-Irish Settlements in VA. 

The will of William Sharp Sr. dated Nov 18, 1826 and probated in Pocahontas County in the May court of 1833, 
lists wife Mary Sharp and ten children: John Sharp, James Sharp, William Sharp, Andrew Sharp, Jane Sharp 
McCollum, Rachael Sharp Griffin, Rebecca Sharp Waddle and Margaret Sharp Kelly, two deceased: Nancy 
Sharp Moore and Mary Sharp Grimes. 

This bio contains bits and pieces from various historical documents. 

Revolutionary War Benefits Applications, 

R.9429 ~ 1832 & 1834 

Last Will & Testament of William Sharp, Sr., probated Mar 1833, Pocahontas Co, WV 

Bio: William Sharp, Sr. - Pocahontas County Pioneer "Lest We Forget" by Rebecca Ann Sharp. Contributed for 
use in USGenWeb Archives by Becky Sharp 



From Jrigdon: Find a Grave ID 48604325 

William was born at the Beverly Manor plantation. His father was killed their by Indians in 1749. His mother 
also supposed to killed by Indians there but exact year isn't known. Court records show William and his siblings 
were orphans. William married Mary Francis Meek who's parents John and Ann were also killed by Indians at 
Calfpasture, Beverly Manor, in 1761. 

~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~ 

William and Mary Sharp are more than likely buried in the Old Huntersville Cemetery, known to be one of the 
oldest cemeteries in Pocahontas County, WV. This is where they were living when they died. This cemetery is 
said to be in very poor condition and reportedly have had old tombstones removed and thrown over the ridge. 

 

  



  



 


